Town of Andes
Regular Monthly Meeting
March 8th, 2016 at 7:00PM

Andes Town Hall
Present: .
Supervisor Wayland ‘Bud’ Gladstone Councilman Shayne Moshier
Councilman Thomas Hall Councilman Dale Cole
Councilman Thomas Joyce Town Clerk Kimberly Tosi

Highway Superintendent Michael McAdams

Others:
Anita Lanziero Don Lanziero
Thomas Coddington-The Reporter

Call to Order:
The meeting was called to order by Supervisor Gladstone at 7:04PM.

Pledge:
The pledge of allegiance was led and recited by Councilman Moshier.

Executive Session:
Motion to enter executive session made by Councilman Hall, Seconded by Councilman Cole.
All in favor., 7:05PM.

RE: Personnel

Motion to exit executive session made by Councilman Moshier, Seconded by Councilman Hall.
All in favor, 7:18PM.

Approval of Minutes:
Motion to approve the February Regular Meeting Minutes, made by Councilman Moshier,
Seconded by Councilman Joyce. All in favor, motion carried.

Privilege of the Floor:
N/A

Reports:
Highway Report 2/10/16 — 3/8/16

Equipment-

2011 Dodge Ram 5500 — Has been at Young’s Dodge getting EGR Cooler replaced under
warranty to solve overheating issues 31,000 miles

-2009 International 4x4 — Greased and checked all fluids and lights. 36,025 miles.

-2009 International 6x6 — Greased and checked all fluids and lights. 44,167 miles.

22004 International 7600 — Greased and checked all fluids, replaced headlight 134,250 miles



-2004 International 4x4 — Greased and checked all fluids and lights, replaced rear spring pin
58,189 miles

-1999 International — Greased and checked all fluids. 192,842 miles

-1999 Oshkosh — Greased and checked all fluids. 1523 hours

-1992 Oshkosh — Replaced front plow hydraulic ram, greased and checked all fluids. 1306 hours
-1996 Volvo Tri-axle — Adjusted brakes, greased and checked all fluids, checked oil in rear ends
-1997 Case 4230 Mower — Replaced 2 hydraulic cylinders, replaced toggle switch for beacon
light

-1994 Morbark Chipper — Has been at Abele Tractor getting repaired. Estimated cost to repair
the chipper is $ 6,500. Abele has given us a price on a newei chipper with only 450 hours on it
for $ 24,000 including trading ours in.

Road Work-

* Lower Dingle Hill Road — We have been out cutting brush aiong the road and using our new
Case mower

* We have been cleaning ditches and fixing washouts due to the heavy rain on Wed. Feb 24,
The most heavily damaged road was Davis hollow. 90 % of the rcad damage was caused by
driveway pipes.

Respectfully Submitted,
Michael McAdams

*NcAdams reported that he is receiving applications at this time o fill the vacant positions.
*McAdams asked the board to address and poteniially adopi a policy regarding the replacement
of driveway pipes. Many individuals in town are living on a fixed income and cannot afford to
replace their pipes. This is causing damage to the town roads. McAdams will be talking to
Delaware County to find out their policy on the issue.

*Supervisor Gladstone asked McAdams if he could find out how much time town has saved this
winter, not having to buy sand and on overtime.

*Councilman Hall asked what happened to the chipper. The pump wouldn’t stay fastened and
this needed to be corrected.

Supervisoi’s Report
#2/70-1 met with Tom Suazzo regarding the well sites and contract. Looked at possible sites at
the Rural Cemetery property on High Street. I have also been in contact with the new owners of
the former Ruff farm behind the Catholic Cnurch about possibly that well. I will be having
further discussions with them regarding this.
*Reccived a letter from the Andes Seniors Group thanking the board for our support. We also
received a donation from Lloyd and Sally Johns for Ballantine Park.
*2/18 Kim sent me a notice that we need zlection inspectors for the Democrat Party. Anyone
interesied should contact the Delaware County Board of Electiois (607) 832-5321.
*2/27 [ attended a meeting in Arkville for the Catskiil Center for Conservation and
Development. The focus was better access (¢ our regior. for recreation and activities.
*3/4- The Flood Commission had their walk thru of the stream through the hamlet.




*3/5. | attended a meeting in Boiceville for a group trying to get train tracks from Kingston to
Arkville to help give people a new way to experience our area.

*3/7- T met with Ann Roberti, Alex Adelson, Marty Donnelly, and Tom Joyce regarding the
railroad station to discuss what types of use will be allowed.

*3/8- [ had a couple phone discussions with 2 gentleman by the name of Alex Wilson from “Way
Side Cider” who is interested in buying the former Decker property on Redden Lane for his cider
production business.

*Thank you to Willow Drey Farm for the food banx fundraisc: they held on February 200, 1t
was very successful.

Respectfully Submitted,
Wayland ‘Bud’ Gladstone

*Courcilman Joyce had a request from Dorothy McArdle regarding the sale and potential water
connection for the old Decker Building cusrently owned oy Bill Dey. The Town does not have
any authority over the situation. It is a private property matter. T he potential buyer will have to
contact George Redden and Bill Day.

Commuittees:
Flood Commission-

Councilman Joyce discussed the waik-through. There will be a public hearing in the near
future.

Pool-

Councilman Joyce reported that he has met with Rachel Andrews and she will be coming
back diis summer. She is now a lifeguard instructor and can teach and re-certify our lifeguards.
This will be a great savings to the Town. All lifeguards will need a raise this year. Rachel
brouglit Joyce a list of things the pool aeeds.

The kiddie pool needs to be hooked up to the main pool. [he parts will be ordered with
Delaware Operations. The storage shed needs a new roof, floor, and ramp. Councilman Hall
suggested that purchasing a new building may be cheaper from a place like the Amish Barn Co.
This will be evalutated. The chairs need o be repiaced. Tie bathrooms have a mold problem.
There is no ventilation. This may b¢ solved by delamidifiers. ihe sidewalk also needs to be
fixed where it was dug up and in another spot on the other side of the pool where some settling
has made a dangerous lip.

It is hopeful that the pool wiii be oper tie week of Juse 27 but no later than July 1°.

Construction-

Supervisor Gladstone reported that taere s currenily some construction going on at the
libraxy.
Economic Development-

Councilman Joyce reported cn the Marca meeting. The brochare and Community
Weekend were discussed. Joyce will be working with Marge Merzig on some potential funding
for ihe brochure.




RR Station-
The railroad station construction is almost complete.

Motions:

Motion to approve the February Supervisor’s Finaucial Report. Justice’s Financial Report, Town
Clerk’s Financial Report and Tax Collector’s Financial Report, made by Councilman Joyce,
Seconded by Councilman Mosher. All in favor, motion carried.

Motion 0 authorize Highway Supenntendent McAdams o advertise for bids for the hauling of
gravel, sand cobbles, bank run sand. bank run gravel & crusher run, to be received by Thursday
Aprii 7" at 12PM. The bids will be opened on April 8 at 9am and awarded on April 12, at
7PM at the regularly scheduled board meeting, made by Councilman Joyce, Seconded by
Councilman Hall. All in favor, motion carriea.

Resolutions:
Resolution 9 of 2016 Highway Bias

Be it resolved, by the Andes Towi Board 10 hereoy accept the fullowing sealed bids:

1.) ARCH PIPE- Delivered to Town of Andes Tremperskiil Pit
127,147,167, 187, 207, 247, 267, 307, 347, 367, 427, 48", 547, 607, 667, 727, 78”,
&47, 887,907, 108, 1207
Steel Sales

2 POLY PIPE- Delivered to Towit o1 Andes rempershdl Pit
127, 147,167, 187,207, 247, 267, 307, 347, 367, 427, 48", 547, 60”
Steel Sales and Chemung Supply

3.) CRUSHED STONE- HAULING ONLY
A, 1L HIAs, #1B's
Price per ton delivered to Andes, NY
Bills go to P.O. Box 240*
Carver Sand and Gravei

4.) GRAVEL, SAND, COBBLES, BANK RUN SAND, BANK RUN GRAVEL &
CRUSHER RUN F.O.B.
Price per yard
*Bills go to P.O. Box 246*
Belaware Bulldozing- 3/8” Sereened Sand
Carver- Crusher Run
[.aFever Sand and Gravel- Rest of bid

5.) SEASONAL MOWING AT SHAVERTOWN CEMETERY
Viowing and trimming grass.
Clean up flowers, sticks, stones, and other debris off the lawn prior to first mowing.
wlay thru end of seascn, every two weens G as needed



Price per season
Copy of insurance MUST be included in bid.
Tri-Town Services

6.) SEASONAL MOWING AT ANDES WATER RESERVOIR, ANDES TOWN HALL,
BOHLMAN PARK, AND OLD HIGHWAY GARAGE (AS NEEDED)
Mowing and trimming grass.
Price per season
Copy of insurance MUST be inciudea in bid.
John Andrews

7.) SEASONAL MOWING AT ANDES TRANSFER STATION
Mowing and trimming
Price per season
Copy of insurance MUST be included in bid.
Tri-Town Services

8.) SEASONAL MOWING AT ANDES RURAL CEMETERY
Mowing and trimming grass.
Price per season.
Copy of insurance MUST be included in bid.
Tri-Town Services

9.) Excavator equal to a 220 with operator.
Including hauling of said excavator.
Copy of insurance certificate MUST be included with bid.
LaFever Excavating

10.)  Equal to a 220 Excavator with a jack hammer and a thumb by monthly rent.
A. Montano

11) Equal to a 160 Excavator with a thumb by monthly rent.
A. Montano

12.)  Equal to a 662B Grader by monthly rent
A. Montano

13.)  Equal to a 310 4-wheel drive Backhoe by monthly rent.
A. Montano

14.) Equal to a 624G Loader by monthly rent
A. Montano

15.)  Tractor with a grass head mower by monthly rent
A. Montano



#3- LaFever not accepted because they will not haul from Carver or Cobleskill who have the
County bid that we use.

#10-14- Monroe Tractor disqualified because not in separate envelopes

All non-collusive bidding certificates and insurance certificates included as needed.

Proposed by: Councilman Joyce
Seconded by: Councilman Hall

Roll Call:

Councilman Joyce==-=====-- Aye
Councilman Hall-----=-~---- Aye
Councilman Cole------=---- Aye
Counciliman Moshier------- Aye
Supervisor Gladstone------ Aye

Approval of Bills:
Motion to approve General Warrants #63-86 totaling $12,107.02

Highway Warrants #40-64 totaling $16,392.80

WWTP Warrants #25-37 totaling $30,955.13

Water Warrants #17-20 totaling $999.72, made by Councilman Joyce, Seconded
by Councilman Hall. All in {avor, motion carried.

Motion to authorize the payment of Dale Kirby’s bill prior to the April Meeting, made by
Councilman Hall, Seconded by Councilman Joyce. All in favor, motion carried.

Motion to approve the payment of Lasting Impressions for the tree removal at Bohlman Park to
be added to the April Warrants, totaling $850.00, made by Councilman Hall, Seconded by
Cournciiinan Moshier. All in favor, motion carried.

Motion 10 approve the payment to the New York State Assessor’s Association to be added to the
April Warrants, totaling $113.00 for & training class for the Assessor, made by Councilman
Joyce, Seconded by Counciiman Hall. All in favor, motion carried.

Districts-

Water:
Motion to approve. upon the recommendation of Cedarwood Engineering, the purchase of a pre-
filter and housing for the water filtration plant at a cost not to exceed $1550, made by
Councilinan Moshier, Seconded by Councilman Hall. Al in favor, motion carried.

Motion to authorize the Supervisor, upon the recommendation of Cedarwood Engineering, to
sign a services contract with Titan Well-Drillers for a test well to begin the secondary well
project at a cost not to exceed $16,000, made by Councilman Joyce, Seconded by Councilman
Moshier. All in favor, motion carried.

*1t is noted this overall project has been previously authorized and SEQR review completed.



Sewer:
-An application and deposit has been received from Robert Fuhrman of 294 Depot Street for a
sewer connection.

Public Comments/Questions:

McAdams stated that a property owner on Beech Hill at the end of Weaver Ave, would like to
gift the town a piece of land to store property on when doing road work throughout the year. He
will be contacting Supervisor Gladstone.

Adjouri:
Motion to adjourn the meeting made by Councilman Hall, Seconded by Councilman Joyce. All
in favor, 8:23PM.



CEDARWOOD ENVIRONMENTAL SERVICES

8-12 Dietz Street, Suite 303, Oneonta NY 13820 e Phone 607-441-3246 ¢ FAX 607-441-3251

TOWN OF ANDES, NY
TOWN BOARD MEETING
REPORT BY CEDARWOOD ENVIRONMENTAL SERVICES
March 4, 2016

1. Water System
Daily usage of treated water from the water system averaged 38,000 gallons per

day for the month of February 2016.

2. Plant Purchases
Regular O&M purchases.

3. O&M

4. Equipment
Installed new filter cartridges, first stage on February 28, 2016 and second stage
filters on February 29, 2016.

5. Distribution System

6. Library Well
Monthly operation of well equipment on February 16, 2016.



CEDARWOOD ENVIRONMENTAL SERVICES

8-12 Dietz Street, Suite 303, Oneonta NY 13820 e Phone 607-441-3246 ¢ FAX 607-441-3251

TOWN OF ANDES, NY
TOWN BOARD MEETING
REPORT BY CEDARWOOD ENVIRONMENTAL SERVICES
March 4, 2016

1. WWTP Plant
Plant effluent flow averaged 42,432 gallons per day for the month of February

2016.
2. SPDES Compliance/NYSDEC, NYCDEP

The plant discharges treated effluent to the Tremper Kill Brook. Permit
compliance for February 2016 met all parameters.

3. Collection System
No issues known at this time.

4. Plant Purchases.
Regular O&M purchases.

5. Plant O&M
All running well

6. Plant Equipment.

7. Gladstone Hollow Septic System



Bid#1 Arch Pipe-Delivered to Town of Andes Tremperskill Pit
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Bid#1 Arch Pipe- Dehvered to

Cheroung

El‘own of Andes Tremperskill Pit

15'

Size Price per linear foot | Bands Each
127 14"x9" 1lé6ga 9.25 9.25
b4 17"x13" " 11.10 11.10
16”7 no bid no bid
187 g1mg15m v 13.90 13.90
29

20 no bid no bid
247 28"x20" " 17.60 17.60
26” o no bid no bid
30” 35"x24" lé4ga 27.75 27.75
34” no bid no bid
36”  427x29" l4ga 33.30 50.00
42”7 49"x33"  12ga 52.75 79.00
43 57"x38" 12ga 60.25 90.25
547 4mx43"  12ga 67.50 101.25
607 gerxs1m  12ga 93.75 141.00
66” 731455"  12ga 108.00 216.00
727 ginxsom  12ga 116.50 232.75
783’

no bid no bid
84” 95"x67" 12ga 133.00 400.00
88~ no bid no bid
90”7 103"x71"  12ga 146.00 438.00
108” 128"x83" 10ga 214.00 642.00
120”142"x91"  10ga 242.00 727.00
TOZ"117"%79" 10ge 185.00 365.00
114" 137"x87" 10ge 265.00 750.00




Bid #2 Poly Pipe-Delivered to Town of Andes Tremperskill Pit

oo N =D

Size

12’?

Price per linear k ot

" Bands Each

5.0 7.4 |
= (55 4.4
e G NlA
e G0 41D
o A M)A
24" | HE >1.95
26” 1A -
e “,.#_____m“__fh_'{l/:% N)A
Y | 2%.89 | 47,22
o Pl A
o 2075 | L0. 47
e deaaz &Y.z,
“b £1.89 102,95,
54” B 7 J‘ ff- ! /\3/4
A . LY )79. 7Y
\/‘E:LTL« <m &S {.J A C.

APPROVED



Chemun 9 Suppl

Bid #2 Poly Pipe-Delivered to Téwn of Andes Tremperskill Pit

Size

IN LINE
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Price per linear foot »_I_Bands Each BELL
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Carver Sand & Gravel LLC

494 western Turnpike

Altamont, NY 12009
Phone: 518-355-0505 Fax: 518-688-2815

March 3, 2016

To: Town of Andes
Attn: Town Board
Re: Bid item #3 Crushed Stone- Hauling Only

Carver Sand & Gravel LLC is pleased to submit the following bid for hauling crushed stone to the
Town of Andles:

Item Hauling Price Per Ton
#1 Stone $10.70
#1ST Stone $10.70
#1A Stone $10.70
#1B Stone $10.70

Notes:
e The prices bid above are for delivery of the designated crushed stone items from the
Carver Sand & Gravel quarry on Route 30 in Schoharie to the Town of Andes
e The Carver Sand & Gravel quarry is an approved source of crushed stone material on the
2016 Delaware County DPW stone bid

Thank you for the opportunity to submit this bid. If you have any questions please contact Brad
Beilen at 518-355-0505.

Respectfully,

7 / g
Bradley s /;@@//
Brad Bellen
Carver Sand & Gravel LLC- Sales Manager



COBLESKILL STONE PRODUCTS, INC.

112 Rock Road., P.O. Box 220
Cobleskill, NY 12043
(518) 234-0221
FAX #(518) 234-0226

March 3,2016

To:Town of Andes

Attn:Michacl McAdams

Re: #3 Crushed Stone Hauling Only

Cobleskill Stone Products,Inc.proposes to delivery stone to the Town of, Andes town barn,
for $10.75 per ton from Cobleskill Stone Products,Inc. Howes Cave or Schoharie plant.

Comments:

The prices quoted above are per ton .and are good for one year from bid date.

Thank you for considering Cobleskill Stone Products,Inc.for this bid.

Sincerely,
Cobleskill Stone Products,Inc.

Yo 1 S27

Shane J. Strong (Vice President of Sales)



DG Construction Service, LLC

220 State Road
Andes, NY 13731
607-437-4515

February 22, 2016

To: Town of Andes
Attn: Town Board
Re: Bid ltem # 3 Material Hauling

DG Construction Service, LLC is pleased to submit the following bid to the
Town of Andes: ‘

Bid # 3: Crushed Stone - Hauling Only, from Schoharie, NY (either
Cobleskill Stone or Carver Sand and Gravel pits) to Town of
Andes/Tremperskill Pit for the price of:

$ 14.50 per ton
Thank you for the opportunity to submit this bid.

Respecitfully
o@u’.@ L )

Donald J. Green Jr., President
DG Construction Service, LLC



LaFever Sand & Gravel, LLC
3135 County Highway 6
Bovina Center, NY 13740
1.800.LaFever Phone: 607.832.4240 Fax: 607.832.4546
www.lafever.com

March 2, 2016

Andes Town Clerk

115 Delaware Ave.

PO Box 125

Andes, NY 13731

Attn: Michael McAdams

Re: #3., Crushed Stone — HAULING ONLY

We, Lalever Sand & Gravel, LLC hereby, offer the following for #5 —~ Crushed Stone — HAULING
ONLY from our Gravel Banks to the Town of Andes Tremperskill Pit and / or site for $9.00 per yard.

Thank you for the opportunity to quote these items.
Respecifully submitted,

M e—

onathan B. LaFever, President
LaFever Sand & Gravel, LLC



Bid #4 Gravel, Sand, Cobbles, Bank Run Sand, Bank Run

Gravel, Crusher Run, & Heavy Rock-FOB
Delawart Rulldozino

Location: Kpwa ¥t 4615 Co. kuwy 1% Dol \l’ 2755

Material Price Per Yard
Bank Run Gravel 4 .05

2” Screened Gravel 7.00
3/8” Screened Sand G- N

%4 Crushed Gravel 1O 6O
2”-6” Cobbles &. 0o

2” Round Stone 9. ¢0

2” Crushed Stone 14 .25

Bank Run Sand

Crusher Run

APPROVED




Bid #4 Gravel, Sand, Cobbles, Bank Run Sand, Bank Run
Gravel, Crusher Run, & Heavy Rock-FOB

Location: 4860 state Route 30 Schoharie, NY

Material Price Per Yard

Bank Run Gravel

2” Screened Gravel

3/8” Screened Sand

%" Crushed Gravel

27-6” Cobbles

2” Round Stone

2” Crushed Stone

Bank Run Sand

Crusher Run $10.44 CY

Submitted By: Carver Sand & Gravel LLC
Date: March 2, 2016

9
Signature: ./2/1%{’ %/{ /%%/

Bradley E. Bellen

APPROVED



Jufever. Sand 4 Gravel Ll

Location: Slooville , Sonti /@/‘%f/ﬁ/aﬁ‘l Fhburt o Wel o

Material Price Per Yard
Bank Run Gravel 4.20

2” Screened Gravel &, 70

3/8” Screened Sand 7. 20

34" Crushed Gravel /0. 02
2”-6” Cobbles 5. 95

2” Round Stone g. G0

2” Crushed Stone /3.2
Bank Run Sand gt
Crusher Run /3. 75

APPROVED



TRI-TOWN SERVICES
P.0. BOX 484, ANDES, NEW YORK 13731
ANDES - MARGARETVILLE - DELHI

Lawn Maintenance Free Reasonable Estimates Backhoe
Gardens Tilled Second Home Prewarming York Rake
Shrubs Planted Snow Plowing

Light Carpentry

Tree Triming — 0/ , )
Bush Hogging For__ /72 &/ " 4 /qﬂ/ﬁ; Q Chimney Sweep

— Contact Bill Drew
B.A # 5 914-676-3206

Date ?//Q//é

B g M | 2379

T g (e &ﬁw

e

APPROVED
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March 1, 2016
PO Box 212
Andes, New York 13731

Andes Town Clerk

115 Delaware Avenue
PO Box 125

Andes, New York 13731

Andes Town Clerk:

Bid # 6 — Scasonal Mowing at Andes Water Reservoir, Andes Town Hall, Bohlman Park,
and Andes Old Highway Garage (as needed).

$1050.00 for the season.

Enclosed is proof of insurance. On the renewal date of April 26, 2016 an updated proof of
insurance will be provided to Town Clerk, if bid is accepted.

Sincerely,

s APPROVED



TRI-TOWN SERVICES
- P.O. BOX 484, ANDES, NEW YORK 13731
ANDES - MARGARETVILLE - DELHI

Lawn Maintenance Free Reasonable Estimates Backhoe
Gardens Tilled Second Home Prewarming York Rake
Shrubs Planted Snow Plowing

Tree Triming . Light Carpentry
Bush Hogging Fo r__j -t ,Z// ﬁ/rJJ’a Chimney Sweep
=
—_— ‘4/ "e &= é Contact Bill Drew
914-676-3206
Date_ 5>~ ol = / é
0‘&( [Hig Zlnagr /1395
77 7
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TRI-TOWN SERVICES
P.O. BOX 484, ANDES, NEW YORK 13731
ANDES - MARGARETVILLE - DELHI

Lawn Maintenance Free Reasonable Estimates

Gardens Tilled Second Home Prewarming
Shrubs Planted

Tree Triming P Mﬁ
Bush Hogging  For ,7/ granA ﬂ;y/
- /
B4 # 7

DateB/Q //é
[ 7

Backhoe
York Rake
Snow Plowing
Light Carpentry
Chimney Sweep

Contact Bill Drew
914-676-3206

A"

7/

APPROVED




TRI-TOWN SERVICES
P.0. BOX 484, ANDES, NEW YORK 13731
ANDES - MARGARETVILLE - DELHI

Lawn Maintenance Free Reasonable Estimates Backhoe
Gardens Tilled Second Home Prewarming York Rake
Shrubs Planted Snt?wC Plowing

Tree Triming — % Light Carpentry
Bush Hogging  For | oM &Z,/ Chimney Sweep
77"2 ﬂ g Contact Bill Drew

914-676-3206

Date 3/92///5

Sovonl  prg ey
WQ W w%w 4 ‘

APPROVED




March 1, 2016
PO Box 212
Andes, New York 13731

Andes Town Clerk

115 Delaware Avenue
PO Box 125

Andes, New York 13731

Andes Town Clerk:
Bid # 8 — Scasonal Mowing at Andes Rural Cemetery
$2500.00 for the season.

Enclosed is proof of insurance. On the renewal date of April 26, 2016 an updated proof of
insurance will be provided to Town Clerk, if bid is accepted.

Sincerely,

}Q“ P\ Clodhacn

John M. Andrews



LaFever Excavating, Inc

3135 County Highwgay 8

Bovina Center, NY 13740
L0o07-B33- 4Vp

February 24, 2016
Michael McAdams P 845-676-4781
Highway Superintendent I 845-676-3914

Town of Andes

We hereby submit specifications and proposal for the rental of an excavator equal to a 220 with
operator including hauling of said excavator to include the following features and price.

9) Excavator equal to a 220 with operator
$ 1,280.00 per day up to 8 hours including hauling.

This proposal amount s figured without adding any N. Y. State Sales Tax. A copy of your tax-
exempt form will eliminate any N.Y. State Sales Tax.

We Propose hereby to furnish equipment and operator —complete in accordance with above
specifications, for the sum of: ONE THOUSAND TWO HUNDRED EIGHTY 00/100 PER
DAY FOR UP TO 8 HOURS PER DAY INCLUDING HAULING ($1.280.00)




A Montano Company Inc.

Phone 845-247-0206 571 Route 212 Saugerties NY ~ www.amontanoco.co

3/1/15

Bid # 10

Equal to a 220 Excavator with a Jack hammer and thumb
Monthly Rental Rate- 12,500.00 price includes trucking.

If you have any questions on the above please write or call.

Thank you,
Chris Eaton
A Montano Co. Inc

Cell # 845-399-3613



A Montano Company Inc.

Phone 845-247-0206 571 Route 212 Saugerties NY www.amontanoco.co

3/1/15

Bid #11

Equal to a 160 excavator with a thumb

Monthly Rental Rate- 4,400.00 includes Trucking To and From Andes.

If you have any questions on the above please write or call.

Thank you,
Chris Eaton
A Montano Co. Inc

Cell # 845-399-3613



A Montano Company Inc.

Phone 845-247-0206 571 Route 212 Saugerties NY ~ www.amontanoco.co

3/1/15

Bid # 12

Equal to a 662B Grader

Monthly Rental Rate- 4,800.00 includes Trucking To and From Andes.

If you have any questions on the above please write or call.

Thank you,
Chris Eaton
A Montano Co. Inc

Cell # 845-399-3613



A Montano Company Inc.

Phone 845-247-0206 571 Route 212 Saugerties NY = www.amontanoco.co

3/1/15

Bid # 13

Equal to a 310 4 wheel drive backhoe

Monthly Rental Rate- 2,400.00 includes Trucking To and From Andes.

If you have any questions on the above please write or call.

Thank you,
Chris Eaton
A Montano Co. Inc

Cell # 845-399-3613

A\PPRAVED



A Montano Company Inc.

Phone 845-247-0206 571 Route 212 Saugerties NY  www.amontanoco.co

3/1/15

Bid # 14

Equal to a 624G loader

Monthly Rental Rate- 3,700.00 includes Trucking To and From Andes.

If you have any questions on the above please write or call.

Thank you,
Chris Eaton
A Montano Co. Inc

Cell # 845-399-3613




A Montano Company Inc.

Phone 845-247-0206 571 Route 212 Saugerties NY ~ www.amontanoco.co

3/1/15

Bid # 15

Tractor with grasshead mower

110hp John Deere 7220 4wd with cab and side boom mower
Monthly Rental Rate- 4,900.00 includes Trucking To and From Andes.

If you have any questions on the above please write or call.

Thank you,
Chris Eaton
A Montano Co. Inc

Cell # 845-399-3613



