1.)

ARCH PIPE- Delivered to Town of Andes Tremperskill Pit

127,157, 187, 24,307, 36”, 427, 48”, 547, 60”, 66>, 727, 84, 90”, 102”, 108™, 114",

1207
Chemung Supply

POLY PIPE- Delivered to Town of Andes Tremperskill Pit
127,147, 167, 187, 207, 24>, 26™, 30™, 34, 36™, 427, 48”, 54", 60”

Chemung Supply

CRUSHED STONE- HAULING ONLY
#1, #15, #1A’s, #1B’s

Price per ton delivered to Andes, NY
*Bills go to P.O. Box 246*

Gerster Trucking

2.)

3.)

CRUSHER RUN STONE F.O.B.
Price per yard
*Bills go to P.O. Box 246*

BANK RUN GRAVEL, 2” SCREENED GRAVEL, 3/8” SCREENED SAND, 3/4”
CRUSHED GRAVEL, 2”-6” COBBLES, 2” ROUND STONE, BANK RUN SAND, &

Material

Price Per Yard

Bank Run Gravel

$4.50- LaFever Sand and Gravel

2” Screened Gravel

$7.10- LaFever Sand and Gravel

3/8” Screened Sand

$7.10- LaFever Sand and Gravel

% Crushed Gravel

$10.95- LaFever Sand and Gravel

27-6” Cobbles

$7.00- Clark Companies

2” Round Stone

$9.75- LaFever Sand and Gravel

Bank Run Sand

$5.00- LaFever Sand and Gravel

Crusher Run (shall be a material
which is a byproduct of secondary
crushing operations NYS DOT type
2 with extra dust for good
compaction)

$12.83/yard or $8.25/ton- Carver
Sand and Gravel




4.)

S.)

6.)

7.)

8.)

9.

SEASONAL MOWING AT SHAVERTOWN CEMETERY, ANDES RURAL
CEMTERY AND ANDES TRANSFER STATION

Mowing and trimming grass.

Clean up flowers, sticks, stones, and other debris off the lawn prior to first mowing.
May thru end of season, every two weeks or as needed

Price per season

Copy of insurance MUST be included in bid.

Tri-Town Services-$4410.00

SEASONAL MOWING AT ANDES WATER RESERVOIR, ANDES TOWN HALL,
BOHLMAN PARK, AND OLD HIGHWAY GARAGE (AS NEEDED)

Mowing and trimming grass.

Price per season

Copy of insurance MUST be included in bid.

John Andrews $1000.00

DELINQUENT MOWING IN HAMLET

Mowing and trimming grass, price per occurrence.

ONLY with direction instruction by the Supervisor or Code Enforcement Officer.
Copy of insurance MUST be included in the bid.

Mountain View Property Management- $40.00/per occurrence. (1/4-
$25; 1/2-$40; 1-$80)

Excavator equal to a 220 with operator.
Including hauling of said excavator.
Copy of insurance certificate MUST be included with bid.

LaFever Excavating- $1800.00

Bucket Truck, with operator, and a working height of 50 feet for rent by the hour and by
the day.
Copy of insurance certificate MUST be included with bid.

**No Bids Received**

Equal to a 220 Excavator with a thumb by monthly rent.
A. Montano $6400.00

Equal to a 160 Excavator with a thumb by monthly rent.
A. Montano $5700.00

Equal to a 662B Grader by monthly rent
A. Montano $5800.00

Equal to a 310 4-wheel drive Backhoe by monthly rent.
A. Montano $3500.00



Equal to a 624G Loader by monthly rent
A. Montano $5600.00

Mowing Tractor with a grass head mower, with a minimum 17° boom with a minimum
48” flail and/or a 50” rotary cutting head by monthly rent

*No Bid Received*

Chipper that will take up 12” wood by monthly rent
A. Montano $4600.00



Bid #1 Poly Pipe-Delivered to Town of Andes Tremperskill Pit

Size Price per linear foot | Bands Each | In Line Bell |
127 6.70 11.05 6.85 '
e
e 15" 8.30 18.50 3.68
18” 11.85 31.35 12.35
m”

" 1
24 17.85 44 .60 18.10 |
282
307 28.30 104.77 29.49
b6 3.4 ]
36” 36.90 144.99 38.40
42” 50.15 212.30 50.70
487 60.57  248.70 61.89
.2 0.4
60” 107.50 385.20 112.10

COMPANY NAME: CHEMUNG SUPPLY CORP




Bid#1 Arch Pipe-Delivered to Town of Andes Tremperskill Pit

Size Gauge | Price per linear foot Bands Each

127 147 x 97 16 12,10 30.00
15~ 17°x 137 16 15.40 38.00
18” 217 x 157 16 19.25 48.00
247|287 x 20 16 A 64.00
307 |357x24” 14 38.50 95.00
36 427x29 14 51.25 126.00
42 49°x 33 12 77.00 190.00
48~ 577 x 38” 12

85.25 210.00
547 64" x 437 12

102.25 250,00
60 667 x 51 12 158.50 465.00
66 737x 55 12 169.00 495.00
72 817 x 597 12

179.50 620.00 .
84” 95” x 677 12

200.00 685.00
90 1037 x 71 12 211.00 725.00

2 1 29 2"

e iz 10 275.00 950.00
108” 128" x 83” 10

290.00 995.00
114” 137 x 877 10 '

‘ 303.00 1075.00

1207 | 1427 x 91 10

316.00 1100.00

COMPANY NAME: CHEMUNG SUPPLY CORP




Bid #2 CRUSHED STONE- HAULING ONLY

Material Price Per Ton
#1 $/0, D pec Ton
#1% ‘7"'7_ﬁc‘n 7o
#1A’s “/a‘/'pé,, —B0
#1B’s K27 e

COMPANY NAME: _ Zoole—ziodsyy




Bid #3 Gravel, Sand, Cobbles, Bank Run Sand, Bank Run
Gravel, Crusher Run, Stone & Cobbles-FOB

Location: B/a)mwite,, Satr ﬁwﬁujl.f 7 [

Material Price Per Yard
‘Bank Run Gravel y 2
2” Screened Gravel y o
3/8” Screened Sand - 7 e
%" Crushed Gravel. o 4%
2”-6” Cobbles jo
7 -
2” Round Stone i 9 ,;g
Bank Run Sand - 5 o0

Crusher Run (shall be a material which
is a byproduct of secondary crushing g SO
operations NYS DOT type 2 with extra
dust for good compaction) .

3

COMPANY NAME: Lteve— Svsd ¢ bpmo/ 11 c.



Bid #3 Gravel, Sand, Cobbles, Bank Run Sand, Bank Run
Gravel, Crusher Run, Stone & Cobbles-FOB

Location:  Rewwae $hr. Doy s

Material Price Per Yard
Bank Run Gravel { wo / y
. e
2” Screened Gravel e /c /
3/8” Screened Sand , - /
.25 [¢ ~/
%> Crushed Gravel " = /
. C7i
2726 Cobbles = o / ]/
< - &

2” Round Stone

Bank Run Sand

Crusher Run (shall be a material which
is a byproduct of secondary crushing
operations NYS DOT type 2 with extra
dust for good compaction)

COMPANY NAME:  Bozrow F. Conen




Bid #3 Gravel, Sand, Cobbles, Bank Run Sand, Bank Run

Gravel, Crusher Run, Stone & Cobbles-FORB

I.mcation: Route 23 Ashland. NY

Bank Run Gravel

~ No Bid

2" Screened Gravel

- No Bid
3/8" Screened Sand .

 NoBid

¥4 Crushed Gravel
S NSO B . (.} .} I

276" Cobbles
... NoUBid

2" Round Stone

No Bid

.. No.Bid

CrusherRun{Shall be a material which |
is a byproduct of secondary crushing
| operations NYS DOT type 2 with extra |
| dust for good compaction) |_$ 1283perCy

($8.25 per ton)

Signatu?r'e: W 2— )} JZ@/\

. Bradley E. Bellen

Title: Sales Manager
Date: March 3, 2021

Carver Sand & Gravel LLC

COMPANY NAME:
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February 26, 2021
PO Box 212
Andes, New York 13731

Andes Town Clerk

115 Delaware Avenue
PO Box 125

Andes, New York 13731

Andes Town Clerk:

Bid # 5 — Seasonal Mowing at Andes Water Reservoir, Andes Town Hall, Bohlman Park,
and Andes Old Highway Garage (as needed). '

$1000.00 for the season.

Enclosed is proof of insurance. On the renewal date of April 26, 2021 an updated proof of
insurance will be provided to Town Clerk, if bid is accepted.

incerely,
%E,L O}éY\ Coder

John M. Andrews



3/2/2021 Print Bid :: Skynova.com

Mountain View Property Management &
Landscapin

Ryan Fleischman

288 Walley Road Franklin, NY 13775
(631)559-8008
mvpmlandscaping@gmail.com

Town of Andes

BID

115 Delaware Ave. Andes NY, 13731 Bid # 0000003
PO Box 125
Bid Date 03/02/2021
item Description Unit Price Quantity Amount
Service Delinquent Mowing in Hamlet: When Requested Mowing 40.00 1.00 40.00

Maintenance

Lot Size Prices:
1/4 Acre: $25
1/2 Acre: $40

NOTES: Mowing maintenance will be provided ONLY when instructed by the Supervisor or Code Enforcement
Officer. Mowing maintenance includes weed whacking and grass blowing of walkways/sidewalks as needed.

Mowing price is determined by the estimated lot size that is requested to be mowed. (Average Price $40).

1 Acre: $80
Subtotal 40.00
Total 40.00
Amount Paid 0.00
Bid $40.00

https:/Amwww.skynova.com/app/bids/print?¢c=3685

1



LaFever Excavating, Inc.
3135 County Highway 6
Bovina Center, NY 13740

Ph: 607-832-4240

March 1, 2021

John Bouton P 845-676-4781
Highway Superintendent F 845-676-3914
Town of Andes

We hereby submit specifications and proposal for the rental of an excavator equal to a 220 with
operator including hauling of said excavator to include the following features and price.

7.) Excavator with thumb equal to a 220 with operator
$ 1,800.00 per day up to 8 hours including hauling.

This proposal amount is figured without adding any N.Y. State Sales Tax. A copy of your tax-
exempt form will eliminate any N.Y. State Sales Tax.

We Propose hereby to furnish equipment and operator —complete in accordance with above
specifications, for the sum of: ONE THOUSAND EIGHT HUNDRED 00/100 ($1,800.00) PER
DAY FOR UP TO 8 HOURS PER DAY INCLUDING HAULING.
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